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Department chair spotlight: 

CHRISTINE JENKINSON
@cej_9917

Psychology, Criminal Justice and 
Social Work are departments that 
prepare their students for the world 
outside of Ashland University.

Dr. Mitchell Metzger, Professor 
and Chair of Psychology, Criminal 
Justice and Social Work, teaches 
the two main questions in psychol-
ogy: why do people think they way 
they do and why do they behave 
the way they do.

“It doesn’t matter if you’re tak-
ing an introductory level course 
or you’re taking a brain anatomy 
class or a social psych course or de-
velopmental course,” Metzger said.  

“Everything revolves around that 
central theme.”

Like most majors, internships or 
research are required for gradu-
ation. For Psychology, students 
have done internships at Dale Roy 
School, Ashland County Mental 
Health Board, Drug and Alcohol 
Rehab centers that are in town.

“Psych is one of those degrees 
where it attracts a lot of people that 
have varied interests,” Metzger 
said. “If I look back over that last 
five to 10 years, it’s probably safe 
to say that half of our graduates 
do what you would stereotypi-
cally think a psychology major 
would do. They go into counsel-
ing, therapy, social work, they go 

into kind of the helping side of the 
profession. Then the other half 
do wildly different things. We’ve 
had students go on to become oc-
cupational therapists, speech and 
language pathologists, human re-
source coordinators. They go into 
management positions, they work 
in business, they kind of go all over 
the place. Some have gone to law 
school, some have gone to med 
school.”

Metzger said that many students 
have come back to him saying how 
they did not know how many jobs 
they were qualified for after earn-
ing a Psychology degree. 

“That really, to me, validates the 
importance of what it is that we’re 
doing here. We’re training students 
to not only understand others, but 
training them to be better writ-
ers, better problem solvers, better 
thinkers, better researchers, and 
that’s the kind of stuff that employ-
ers want. Employers want an em-
ployee that can do work on their 
own, that they can think outside 
the box, that they can experience a 
problem and solve it on their own. 
They want people who are think-
ers and that’s one of the things that 
we do and I think we do that very 
well,” he said.

One thing Metzger cautions is 
that once students graduate from 
AU, they are not psychologists. 
They need additional training to 
be a counselor or therapist.

Dr. Allyson Drinkard, Assistant 
Professor of Criminal Justice and 

Sociology, has the goal of broaden-
ing her students’ minds when they 
graduate to the workforce.

“The criminal justice system is 
huge and we really want to have 
people employed in criminal jus-
tice who are ethical, who under-
stand social issues and how they 
relate,” Drinkard said.

Students can major or minor in 
Criminal Justice, but only minor in 
Sociology. Both received a revamp 
in the past two years.

“We’ve started infusing a lot 
more research classes and research 
requirements into the program,” 
Drinkard said.  “So prior to the 
last couple of years, it was really 
more law enforcement based, and 
now we’ve really expanded the 
program to allow for students in-
terested in graduate school, who 
want to be criminologists as op-
posed to law enforcement or police 
officers and so we’ve created these 
specializations now within the ma-
jor that offer a lot more opportuni-
ties to students.”

Internships in this department 
are for students to get job train-
ing and build connections for after 
graduating

“I just created the Center for 
Community Research and Evalu-
ation Services and that center has 
the goal of working with com-
munity members to provide them 
with research and evaluation at a 
reduced cost,” Drinkard said.

Students have worked in Safety 
Service here on campus, Holmes 

County Department of Job and 
Family Services, Mansfield Cor-
rectional Institution, Central Ohio 
Youth Center, Law offices, other 
correctional facilities, counseling 
center, insurance companies, one 
student works at an orphanage, 
many students go on to work in 
police departments, Ohio Depart-
ment of Rehabilitation and the 
FBI.

Social Work has been an accred-
ited department at Ashland Uni-
versity since 1987. Dr. Michael Vi-
mont, Associate Professor of Social 
Work, prepares his students for this 
“helping profession.”

“It’s rooting the idea of working 
with people in their environment,” 
Vimont said. “In order to be able 
to fully appreciate the situation is 
to understand the person and un-
derstand the environment they are 
in and then to develop some type of 
plan of action that either addresses 
things that the individual can do on 
their own to change things because 
most of the time they’re coming to 
the social worker who with a prob-
lem to be addressed. And so the 
focus can be on the individual, but 
often times the focus is not the indi-
vidual himself or herself, the focus 
could be something in the commu-
nity that needs to be changed not 
only to help that person, but help 
others in similar situations.”

Read the rest at AU-Live.com
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For this week’s business spotlight, 
we decided to go to The Cad-
dyshack Indoor Golf and Fun lo-
cated at 1640 Claremont Ave. The 
Caddyshack is a five minute drive 
from campus and gives the small 
town of Ashland a big city experi-
ence. The business has golf simula-
tors, pool tables and arcade games 
with a bar and grille attached as 
well. One of us has previously ex-
perienced The Caddyshack and 
the other has not, so we decided to 
go with some friends and go for the 
group experience.

First Impression:
Bree:  I have lived in Ashland 

my whole life, I drive by The Cad-
dyshack everyday on my way to 
AU and I always thought it was 
just golf simulators. I did not know 
what to expect when we got there 
since I am not a very good golfer 
but I loved that they had so much 
more to offer than just golf. It defi-
nitely was not what I was expecting 
but I loved it! 

Zach: I am not a drinker, but 
you do not need to be a drinker to 
experience The Caddyshack. ‘The 
Shack’ is a place for everyone to en-
joy a good time while playing some 
fun arcade games, so I was very 
impressed the first time I went. 

Atmosphere:
Bree: The atmosphere is super 

chill and a variety of music was 
constantly playing while we were 
there. For the amount of people 
that were there, it never felt crowd-
ed. The overall environment is 
very welcoming for those who are 
just looking to hangout.

Zach: It’s a great atmosphere! 
They usually have live music on 
the weekends and if not live music 
then they usually play good coun-
try music. It makes it a chill atmo-
sphere with a lot of townies but that 
makes for a really great place just 
to hangout and chill on a Friday or 
Saturday night.

Employee Interactions:
Bree: We did not get that much 

interaction with the employees ex-
cept with the bartender, who was 
very nice and accommodating. 

Zach: The employees at The 
Caddyshack are great people and 
they help you get set up with the 
games if you are interested in that. 

Activites:
Bree: Like I said before, I was 

not expecting a whole lot of activi-
ties since I thought it was all golf 
related but there is so much to do! 
There are things like darts, Jenga, 
corn hole and arcade games that 
you can play along with the simu-
lators. You are able to play the ar-
cade games for free as long as you 

spend a minimum of $5, which 
makes it affordable for everyone.

Zach: There are so many differ-
ent arcade games and other games 
that you can play at The Cad-
dyshack for free or for cheap pay-
ment. If you are willing to play on 
the simulators for a half an hour or 
an hour with friends, that makes 
for a cheap round if everyone chips 
in. 

Food/Drink:
Bree: When it comes to drinks, 

The Caddyshack has the option 
of getting a bucket of beer for $10, 
which in my opinion, is a great 
deal. Food wise, we got ‘The Nor-
mal’ pizza and it was pretty good 
but when is pizza not good?

Zach: When we ordered food, 
we kept it pretty simple (because 
Bree is a picky eater) and ate ‘The 
Normal’ which is their pizza with 
sauce, pepperoni and cheese. The 
rest of their menu consists of other 
pizzas, sandwiches and a large ap-
petizer section. 

Overall Experience:
Bree: I would definitely go back 

again now that I know what The 
Caddyshack is and what they have 
to offer. I like the atmosphere and 
overall mindset that is not a regular 
bar that you would go too. Their 
slogan of “Come for the Golf, Stay 
for the Fun” fits and is totally true. 
10/10 would recommend to my 

friends to experience. 
Zach: If you are an upperclass-

man and are over the loud bars 
with dancing all around, then The 
Caddyshack is the place for you. 
I do think that they need to do a 
better job of advertising because if 
you are new in town and drive past 
‘The Shack’ then you may think it 
is a regular golf facility, not a bar. 
Other than that I would give ‘The 
Shack’ a 10/10 for overall experi-
ence. 

Since we brought some people 
with us, we wanted to see what 
they also had to say about their 
time at The Caddyshack. Jay Slone 
and Ben Haraway came along and 
gave us their opinion on The Cad-
dyshack.

Ben: The Caddyshack is an in-
door golf facility that is also a sports 
bar. Inside there are five golf simu-
lators that have screens that you 
can hit golf balls into. The combi-
nation of screens and cameras do 
a great job of determining how far 
your golf ball will go. Along with 
distance, it tracks direction and 
curvature of the ball so it can ac-
curately simulate a round of golf. 
This is what draws customers but 
when the customers arrive they re-
alize that there is much more to it 
than an indoor golf facility! Inside 
there is a sports bar that has a wide 
selection of food and drinks. They 

have many different activities like 
billiards, corn hole, darts and gi-
ant Jenga. The Caddyshack also 
has arcade games like Golden Tee 
Golf, Bags and Silver Strike Lanes. 
Also, they have great deals. If you 
spend $5 then you can play any 
of these games and activities with 
no additional cost. You can buy a 
bucket of five beers for just $10 so 
if you and a friend split it then you 
can play all the games and activi-
ties you like! The Caddyshack also 
promotes responsible drinking by 
giving designated drivers free pop 
for as long as you are there. Over-
all, I think it is a really fun place to 
hangout and play some games with 
the boiz.

Jay: The Caddyshack is my fa-
vorite place in town to kick back 
and relax. The best parts are that 
the people are very nice, the ar-
cade games are free and the prices 
are cheap. Plus, they have some 
killer pizza. ‘The Shack’ also has a 
great, open lay out that gives you 
space to move freely and not feel 
like you are right on top of people, 
like some places similar. Overall, 
every time I know we are going 
to ‘The Shack’, I know it will be a 
great time.


